



THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT
75 North Pace Blvd.
Pensacola, FL 32505

BID AWARD NOTICE

DATE:
October 4, 2023

BID TITLE & REFERENCE:
**Miscellaneous Paper Products & Cleaning
Supplies for School Cafeterias, Bid #240402**

DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE:

An annual agreement, with a one (1) year renewal option, to provide miscellaneous paper products and cleaning supplies for school cafeterias to be stocked and distributed by the Central Warehouse. Thirty-five (35) items bid, with twenty-six (26) items awarded. Nine (9) Items not awarded are due to lack of bidder response and/or samples either not meeting specification or submitted. Items will be purchased as needed to meet cafeteria usage requirements. Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications.

Effective Dates: October 18, 2023 through September 30, 2024.

REQUESTED BY:

Food Services

SUPPLIER NAME:	ITEMS AWARDED:	EST. ANNUAL EXPENDITURE:
Head to Heels, Miami Lakes, FL	2	\$ 33,877.00
Interboro Packaging, Montgomery, NY	6	\$ 96,066.50
Merchants Paper Co., Pensacola, FL	6	\$ 91,428.50
Pyramid School Products, Tampa, FL	2	\$ 999.44
Supreme Paper Supplies, Pensacola, FL	10	\$ 72,533.25

AMOUNT OF PURCHASE:

\$294,904.69 Est. /Yr.

FUNDING SOURCE:

Food Services Fund (4110)

METHOD OF PROCUREMENT:

ECSD Bid

Bids Received: 11 Bids Rejected: 3

DATE AND TIME POSTED:

October 4, 2023, 10:40 a.m. CST

**THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT
75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FLORIDA 32505
BID TABULATION**

DATE: October 4, 2023

Awarded Items are highlighted

BID NBR: 240402

BID TITLE: Miscellaneous Paper Products & Cleaning Supplies for School Cafeterias

ITEM	Cups, Cold Portion Container		Lids, Cold Portion Container		Lids, Hot/Cold Container		Cups, Cold Beverage	
Quantity:	2 oz		2 oz		10 oz		12 oz	
	200	cs	150	cs	75	cs	75	cs
	0702131		0702191		0700270		0702240	
ITEM NUMBER	1		2		3		4	
Calico Packaging								
Jessup, MD	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Central Poly-Bag Corp.								
Linden, NJ	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Head to Heels								
Miami Lakes, FL	50.62		38.09		95.56		82.66	
Interboro Packaging								
Montgomery, NY	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Merchants Paper Co.								
Pensacola, FL	23.45	au	24.45	au	31.70		48.30	
Pyramid School Products								
Tampa, FL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Supreme Paper Supplies								
Pensacola, FL	25.65		23.00		25.87		66.45	
Unipak Corp								
West Long Branch, NJ	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	

ITEM	Bowl Insulated, Foam White		Bowl Insulated, Foam Black		Lids, Plastic, Clear, Vented		Trays, Individual Food Items	
Quantity:	10 oz		10 oz		10 oz		1/4 lb	
	300	cs	300	cs	200	cs	50	cs
	0700065		(New Item)		0700075		0702450	
ITEM NUMBER	5		6 - DELETED		7		8 - DELETED	
Calico Packaging								
Jessup, MD	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Central Poly-Bag Corp.								
Linden, NJ	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Head to Heels								
Miami Lakes, FL	103.61		No Bid		61.30		No Bid	
Interboro Packaging								
Montgomery, NY	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Merchants Paper Co.								
Pensacola, FL	52.92		No Bid		43.50		23.00	au
Pyramid School Products								
Tampa, FL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Supreme Paper Supplies								
Pensacola, FL	97.80		No Bid		33.72		No Bid	
Unipak Corp								
West Long Branch, NJ	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
ITEM	Trays, Individual Food Items		Trays, Individual Food Items		Dipping Tray, 2-Compartment		Bag, Hot Dog, Silver Foil	
Quantity:	1/2 lb		1 lb		w/Hinged Flat Lid		Single Serve	
	200	cs	300	cs	200	cs	75	cs
	0702460		0702470		0700080		0702845	
ITEM NUMBER	9		10		11		12	
Calico Packaging								
Jessup, MD	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Central Poly-Bag Corp.								
Linden, NJ	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Head to Heels								
Miami Lakes, FL	53.57		77.21		No Bid		No Bid	
Interboro Packaging								
Montgomery, NY	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Merchants Paper Co.								
Pensacola, FL	25.35	au	33.85	au	58.15		79.70	
Pyramid School Products								
Tampa, FL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Supreme Paper Supplies								
Pensacola, FL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		58.90	
Unipak Corp								
West Long Branch, NJ	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	

ITEM Quantity: ITEM NUMBER	Bags, Paper Sandwich Open Top 100 0702800 cs		Bags, Plastic, Gallon Size Zipper Top 1200 0702825 cs		Bag, Sandwich Size Foil Lined 130 0702840 cs		Knives, Disposable Plastic Single Service 25 0702020 cs	
	13		14		15 - DELETED		16	
Calico Packaging								
Jessup, MD	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Central Poly-Bag Corp.								
Linden, NJ	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Head to Heels								
Miami Lakes, FL	112.60		106.98	au	No Bid		39.19	
Interboro Packaging								
Montgomery, NY	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Merchants Paper Co.								
Pensacola, FL	42.30		42.35		No Bid		7.90	au
Pyramid School Products								au
Tampa, FL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		8.15	m
Supreme Paper Supplies								
Pensacola, FL	28.30		49.65		No Bid		9.34	
Unipak Corp								
West Long Branch, NJ	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
ITEM Quantity: ITEM NUMBER	Forks, Disposable Plastic Single Service 600 0702010 cs		Spoons, Disposable Plastic 600 0702030 cs		Hair Nets, Invisible Rayon, Honey Comb 200 0750485 cs		Hair Nets, 24" Black Bouffant 200 New Item cs	
	17		18		19		20 - DELETED	
Calico Packaging								
Jessup, MD	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Central Poly-Bag Corp.								
Linden, NJ	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Head to Heels								
Miami Lakes, FL	45.29		42.41		No Bid		No Bid	
Interboro Packaging								
Montgomery, NY	No Bid		No Bid		9.98		No Bid	
Merchants Paper Co.								
Pensacola, FL	7.90		7.90		12.05	au	No Bid	
Pyramid School Products								
Tampa, FL	8.07	my	8.07	my	No Bid		No Bid	
Supreme Paper Supplies								
Pensacola, FL	9.34		9.34		10.17		No Bid	
Unipak Corp								
West Long Branch, NJ	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	

ITEM Quantity: ITEM NUMBER	Gloves, Plastic, Serving Disposable 25 0702060 pk		Scouring Pads, Course Fiber White, Hand Size, 3.5x5x3/4 100 0701255 bx		Scouring Pads, Fine Fiber White, Hand Size, 6x9x3/8 40 0701245 bx		Scouring Sponge Stainless Steel 50 0701270 bx	
	21		22		23		24 - DELETED	
Calico Packaging								
Jessup, MD	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Central Poly-Bag Corp.								
Linden, NJ	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Head to Heels								
Miami Lakes, FL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Interboro Packaging								
Montgomery, NY	6.98		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Merchants Paper Co.								
Pensacola, FL	No Bid		46.65	au	6.45	au	6.15	au
Pyramid School Products								au
Tampa, FL	0.79	mu	9.98	my	6.99	my	5.99	m
Supreme Paper Supplies								
Pensacola, FL	No Bid		9.95		No Bid		No Bid	
Unipak Corp								
West Long Branch, NJ	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
ITEM Quantity: ITEM NUMBER	Soap Powder Laundry and Cleaning 550 0701060 cs		Polish Liquid Aluminum 16 0701160 gal		Hood Detergent Auto Wash, Nonflammable 15 0701070 cs		Cleaner Tablets, Rational Combi Oven 8 New Item pail	
	25		26		27 - DELETED		28 - DELETED	
Calico Packaging								
Jessup, MD	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Central Poly-Bag Corp.								
Linden, NJ	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Head to Heels								
Miami Lakes, FL	No Bid		66.30	au	No Bid		224.99	
Interboro Packaging								
Montgomery, NY	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Merchants Paper Co.								
Pensacola, FL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Pyramid School Products								
Tampa, FL	No Bid		44.99	my	No Bid		No Bid	
Supreme Paper Supplies								
Pensacola, FL	72.50		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Unipak Corp								
West Long Branch, NJ	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	

ITEM	Care Tablets, Rational Combi Oven	Food Service Wipe Disposable	Clamshell, Small, Clear Plastic, 8 oz, hinged lid	Garbage Can Liners 20 gal can
Quantity:	8	600	2100	150
ITEM NUMBER	New Item	0703095	0700155	0702890
	29 - DELETED	30	31- DELETED	32
Calico Packaging				
Jessup, MD	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	24.94
Central Poly-Bag Corp.				
Linden, NJ	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	14.90
Head to Heels				
Miami Lakes, FL	270.03	105.22	No Bid	No Bid
InterboroPackaging - Bid A				
Montgomery, NY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	17.68
Interboro Packaging- Bid B				
Montgomery, NY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	13.48
Interboro Packaging- Bid C				
Montgomery, NY	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	11.68 p
Merchants Paper Co.				
Pensacola, FL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	11.65
Pyramid School Products				
Tampa, FL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Supreme Paper Supplies				
Pensacola, FL	No Bid	11.53	No Bid	26.06
Unipak Corp				
West Long Branch, NJ	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	14.88

ITEM Quantity: ITEM NUMBER	Garbage Can Liners 56 gal can 5000 0702920		Baker's Rack Cover Disposable 100 0702510		Bags, Plastic Gallon Size 200 0702835	
	33	cs	34	cs	35	cs
Calico Packaging						
Jessup, MD	29.44		15.74		No Bid	
Central Poly-Bag Corp.						
Linden, NJ	22.50		13.90		No Bid	
Head to Heels						
Miami Lakes, FL	No Bid		No Bid		91.80	
Interboro Packaging- Bid A						
Montgomery, NY	33.24	au	See pricing below		See pricing below	
Interboro Packaging- Bid B						
Montgomery, NY	25.48		See pricing below		See pricing below	
Interboro Packaging- Bid C						
Montgomery, NY	17.72		13.48		10.98	
Merchants Paper Co.						
Pensacola, FL	No Bid		20.65	au	42.35	
Pyramid School Products						
Tampa, FL	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Supreme Paper Supplies						
Pensacola, FL	No Bid		No Bid		49.65	
Unipak Corp						
West Long Branch, NJ	17.64	au	No Bid		No Bid	

NOTES:

a=Alternate product

au=Alternate product unacceptable, no sample sent, or sample not approved

ay = Sample received and approved

m = Vendor bid minimum shipment / my = Minimum shipment acceptable

mu=Minimum shipment unacceptable

my=Minimum shipment acceptable

p=Awarded by package size

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for seventy-two (72) hours in the Procurement Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: <https://escambiaschools.org/Page/1048>. Notices will not be automatically mailed. Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Procurement website address. Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes will constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statutes.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

Allison Watson

Allison Watson, Director
Procurement Department